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Over the past several years, one of the main priorities of the Mid-Atlantic – Russia Business Council has been 
Russian-American cooperation in energy efficiency and renewable energy technology.  To achieve this goal, 
MARBC organizes American and Russian participation in the most important international clean energy technology 
conferences.   
 
MARBC will continue to organize American and Russian participation in leading renewable energy and energy 
efficiency events, including the Renewable Energy Finance Forum-Wall Street (REFF Wall Street) in New 
York on June 25-26, 2013, Renewable Energy Technology Conference and Exhibition (RETECH) in 
Washington, D.C. on September 9-11, 2013, Greenbuild in Philadelphia on November 20-22, 2013, National 
Renewable Energy Policy Forum in Washington, D.C. in February 2014, and Mid-Atlantic Energy Technology 
Forum in Philadelphia in April 2014.  
            
REFF Wall Street, in New York on June 25-26, is the leading renewable energy financing event in the country. 
Organized jointly by American Council on Renewable Energy and Euromoney, the event will discuss the main 
challenges currently facing renewable energy and provide insight into future business opportunities in this sector.  
REFF Wall Street creates the opportunity to hear from those that are defying the existing industry challenges to 
create innovative financing solutions and offers you the chance to share your perspectives throughout the discussion 
on the direction of the market.  The meeting also presents the chance to network with senior officials and 
professionals in the renewable energy finance industry.  As a supporting organization of REFF Wall Street, 
MARBC will offer a special 20% discount with registration code: SPT20MAR.  For additional information about 
REFF Wall Street, visit  http://www.reffwallstreet.com/ 
   
RETECH, in Washington, D.C. on September 9-11, is the premier trade gathering of the all-renewable energy 
industry in the United States.  The event offers an excellent opportunity to network with high-level industry 
representatives and forward-thinking, focused organizations with a global view.  This three-day technology 
conference and exhibition features a trade show and six tracks of top CEO-led business conference sessions by 
technology, as well as multiple business-to-business side events. As a supporting organization of RETECH, 
MARBC will offer a special 20% discount with registration code: RTRD1. For additional information about 
RETECH, visit http://www.retech2013.com 
 
Greenbuild, in Philadelphia on November 20-22, is the largest green building conference in the world, bringing 
together industry leaders and professionals to network and discuss sustainable building in business.  MARBC will 
bring Russian participation to the event and partake in a panel discussion exploring recent developments in the 
renewable energy and energy technology industries in energy rich countries.   For additional information about 
Greenbuild, visit  http://greenbuildexpo.org 
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The National Renewable Energy Policy Forum: “Moving From Politics to Policy: Advancing the Business of 
Renewable Energy”, organized by the American Council on Renewable Energy, will take place in February 2014 
on Capitol Hill and will include discussions by renewable energy leaders from across the country involving the 
present state of renewable energy policy and addressing the need for future action by policymakers.  There will be 
several opportunities to network with high-ranking public and private sector officials in the fields of energy and 
policy who are concentrating on renewable and clean energy technologies.   
 
The ACORE’s National Policy Forum began with the goal of implementing the United States’ new energy 
technologies for the benefit of the nation’s economy and to better fulfill its energy needs.  Yet serious policy 
reforms are needed for this goal to be realized.  The forum will develop a policy framework in line with the key 
economic challenges facing the renewable energy industry today.  For additional information about the National 
Renewable Energy Policy Forum, visit www.acorepolicyforum.com.   
 
The Mid-Atlantic Energy Technology Forum in Philadelphia in April 2014 is organized by the Venture Group of 
Blank Rome LLP, the Academy of Natural Sciences, and the Cleantech Alliance Mid-Atlantic. The forum will 
feature a panel of industry leaders in energy technology venture and corporate investing, as well as presentations by 
leading Mid-Atlantic energy technology start-up companies. More information can be found at  
http://www.BlankRome.com/EnergyTechForum/ 
 
MARBC would like to invite you to take part in these clean energy events, which will offer exceptional 
opportunities to network with industry leaders and progressive, global organizations. MARBC is a supporting 
organization of these events and is working to expand the participation of Russian delegations and to develop 
Russian business exposition.  For further information, please contact Val Kogan, President of the MARBC, by 
phone at: (484) 467-7444, via email at: val@ma-rbc.org or by visiting the MARBC website: http://www.ma-rbc.org 


